Sharron Miles

From: Marlene.Chowning@gmfinancial.com

Sent: Sunday, June 24, 2018 7:28 PM

To: larkatetens@gmail.com; smilesrotary5790@gmail.com

Cc: okbc2000@aol.com; bettybengo@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Receipts for grant

Attachments: Rotary Checking Account Statements - 05_15_2018 - 200093904.pdf; Check #2029
image.htmi

Sorry, finally got this done. Here is the bank statement that shows on page 3 both the deposit of the grant money of
$750.00 on 5/10/2018 and check #2029 for $1,500.00 payable to cash on 5/14/2018 for the grant money and our club
matching funds. The cash was given to Betty Bengo to carry to Uganda to purchase the mosquito nets there to save on
bank fees and exchange fees.

From: Larka Tetens [larkatetens@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, June 22, 2018 11:34 AM

To: Sharron Miles

Cc: Bruce Chowning; Chowning, Marlene; betty bengo
Subject: Receipts for grant

Hi, Sharron. Hope you are doing well. Betty Bengo is in Uganda at Malaika Children’s Orphanage until August
25. She has received receipts for $1500 thus far. I’'m not sure how to upload them on the Matching Grants
website. Can you help with this, please?

Thank you again!
Larka Tetens
Arlington Sunset Rotary



